



Agenda

REGULAR MEETING OF
THE GOVERNING BODY
AUGUST 8, 2018
CITY COUNCIL CHAMBERS

AFTERNOON SESSION – 5:00 P.M.

1. CALL TO ORDER
2. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
3. SALUTE TO THE NEW MEXICO FLAG
4. INVOCATION
5. ROLL CALL
6. APPROVAL OF AGENDA
7. APPROVAL OF CONSENT CALENDAR
8. APPROVAL OF MINUTES: Regular City Council Meeting – July 25, 2018
9. PRESENTATIONS
10. CONSENT CALENDAR
 - a) Request for Approval of Memorandum of Understanding for Continued City Involvement in the LEAD Policy Coordinating Committee; No Fiscal Impact. (Julie Sanchez)
 - b) Request for the Approval of Vendor Agreement #2018-19-60026 in the Total Amount of \$784,503.90 for FY 2018/19 for Direct Purchase of Services - Congregate Meals, Home Delivered Meals, Transportation, Homemaker/Housekeeping, In-Home Respite Care and GRGC Respite Vouchers; North Central New Mexico Economic Development District Non-Metro Area Agency. (Gino Rinaldi)
 - c) Request for Approval of Award of RFP 18/34/P and Professional Services Agreement in the Total Amount of \$280,000, Plus NMGRT, for Database Development, Training and Support Services for Utility Billing Division; Mountain River Consulting. (Joshua Elicio).

RECEIVED AT THE CITY CLERK'S OFFICE

DATE: August 3, 2018

TIME: 10:00 PM



Agenda

REGULAR MEETING OF
THE GOVERNING BODY
AUGUST 8, 2018
CITY COUNCIL CHAMBERS

- d) Request for Approval of Award of the Fire Department Uniform Bid (18-26-B) in the Amount to Exceed \$60,000 for Uniforms to Multiple Vendors; Galls, Capital City Uniforms, LN Curtis, Roadrunner Screen Printers. (Jan Snyder)
- e) Request for Approval of Budget Amendment for Local Match on Approved New Mexico Department of Transportation (NMDOT) Grant Agreement SAF-18-05 in the Amount of \$120,797 for the Santa Fe Municipal Airport. (Nick Schiavo and Mark Baca)
- f) Request for Approval of Procurement in the Amount of \$1,040,040 (Inclusive of NMGRT) for Two (2) Heavy Duty 30-Foot Low-Floor CNG Near Zero Emissions Buses Via Cooperative Agreement from the State of Virginia Cooperative Agreement #E194-75548 MA 2274; Gillig LLC. (Keith Wilson)
 - 1) Request for Approval of Amendment No. 1 to Contract #18-0554 to Add the Purchase of Two Buses and Extend the Term of the Agreement to July 31, 2021.
- g) CONSIDERATION OF RESOLUTION NO. 2018-____. (Councilor Villarreal and Councilor Ives)
A Resolution in Support of Reauthorization of and Full Funding for the Land and Water Conservation Fund. (Jesse Guillen)
- h) CONSIDERATION OF RESOLUTION NO. 2018-____. (Mayor Webber, Councilor Ives, Councilor Villarreal and Councilor Lindell)
A Resolution in Opposition to the Trump Administration's Efforts to Include a Question Regarding Citizenship on the 2020 Census; Encouraging Concerned Citizens to Express Their Opinion During the Public Comment Period, and Forwarding a Copy of This Resolution to the New Mexico Congressional Delegation Urging Them to Oppose the Inclusion of a Citizenship Question on the 2020 Census. (Jesse Guillen)
- i) Request for Approval of Professional Services Agreement in the Amount of \$124,689.28 for the Development/Design Services for the Agua Fria/South Meadows Intersection Improvement Project; Santa Fe Engineering. (David Quintana)
 - 1) Request for Approval of Budget Amendment in the Amount of \$200,000.



Agenda

REGULAR MEETING OF
THE GOVERNING BODY
AUGUST 8, 2018
CITY COUNCIL CHAMBERS

11. Request to Publish Notice of Public Hearing on September 12, 2018:
Community Development Block Grant 2017-2018 Consolidated Annual
Performance Evaluation Review (CAPER). (Jacqueline Beam)
12. MATTERS FROM THE CITY MANAGER
13. MATTERS FROM THE CITY ATTORNEY
14. MATTERS FROM THE CITY CLERK
15. COMMUNICATIONS FROM THE GOVERNING BODY

EVENING SESSION – 7:00 P.M.

- A. CALL TO ORDER
- B. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
- C. SALUTE TO THE NEW MEXICO FLAG
- D. INVOCATION
- E. ROLL CALL
- F. PETITIONS FROM THE FLOOR
- G. APPOINTMENTS
 - Bicycle & Trail Advisory Committee
- H. PUBLIC HEARINGS:
 - 1) CONSIDERATION OF BILL NO. 2018-14: ADOPTION OF ORDINANCE
NO. 2018-____. (Councilor Lindell, Councilor Romero-Wirth and Councilor
Villarreal)
An Ordinance Relating to the City of Santa Fe Uniform Traffic Ordinance;
Amending Section 12-9-3.9 Regarding the Failure to Properly Display a
Parking Placard as a Defense Against a Charge of Violation of the
Subsection; and Amending Subsection 12-9-4.5(B) to Allow for a Reduced
Deposit for First Time Offenders of a Designated ADA Accessible Parking
Violation Who Request an Administrative Hearing. (Jesse Guillen)



Agenda

REGULAR MEETING OF
THE GOVERNING BODY
AUGUST 8, 2018
CITY COUNCIL CHAMBERS

- 2) CONSIDERATION OF RESOLUTION NO. 2018-____. (Mayor Webber, Councilor Lindell, Councilor Harris and Councilor Vigil Coppler)
A Resolution Acknowledging the City's Public Outreach and Market Research Efforts to Date that Constitute the "Concept Phase" of the Redevelopment Process of the City-Owned Property at the Former Campus of the College of Santa Fe and the Santa Fe University of Art and Design, Now Referred to as the City's Midtown Property; Adopting Planning Guidelines for Future Uses of the Midtown Property Developed Through the Concept Phase; and Authorizing Commencement of the "Planning Stage" of the Redevelopment Process of the Midtown Property. (Matthew O'Reilly)

- 3) CONSIDERATION OF RESOLUTION NO. 2018-____. (Councilor Romero-Wirth, Councilor Ives and Councilor Villarreal)
A Resolution Calling for a Municipal Election on a Question to be Placed on the November 6, 2018 Santa Fe County General Election Ballot for the Purpose of Voting For or Against Amending Provisions of the Santa Fe Municipal Charter Regarding Election Dates and the Date Officials Take Office. (Zachary Shandler and Yolanda Vigil) **(Postponed on July 25, 2018)**

Resolución Que Convoca Una Elección Municipal Sobre Una Pregunta Que Se Colocará en la Boleta Electoral de la Elección General del Condado de Santa Fe Que Tendrá Lugar el 6 de Noviembre de 2018, con el Fin de Votar a Favor o En Contra de Enmendar las Disposiciones de la Carta Constitucional de la Municipalidad de Santa Fe Relativas a las Fechas de las Elecciones y a la Fecha en Que los Funcionarios Asumen Sus Cargos.

I. ADJOURN

Pursuant to the Governing Body Procedural Rules, in the event any agenda items have not been considered prior to 11:30 p.m. such items shall be postponed to a subsequent meeting, provided that the date, time and place of such meeting is specified at the time of postponement.

NOTE: New Mexico law requires the following administrative procedures be followed when conducting "quasi-judicial" hearings. In a "quasi-judicial" hearing all witnesses must be sworn in, under oath, prior to testimony and will be subject to reasonable cross-examination. Witnesses have the right to have an attorney present at the hearing.

Persons with disabilities in need of accommodations, contact the City Clerk's office at 955-6521, five (5) working days prior to meeting date.

SUMMARY INDEX
SANTA FE CITY COUNCIL
August 8, 2018

ITEM	ACTION	PAGE
1. Call to Order	Convened at 5:00 p.m.	1
5. Roll Call	Quorum Present	1
6. Approval of Agenda	Approved as amended	1-2
7. Approval of Consent Agenda	Approved as amended	2
8. Approval of Minutes - July 25, 2018	Approved as presented	2-3
9. Presentations	Flood Response	3
10. Consent Calendar Listing	Listed	3-4
Consent Calendar Discussion		
g. Land & Water Conservation Fund	Approved	4-5
h. Opposing Citizenship on 2020 Census	Approved	5
11. CAPER Publish Notice of Public Hearing	Approved to publish notice	5-6
12. Matters from the City Manager	None	6
13. Matters from the City Attorney	None	6
14. Matters from the City Clerk	Announced next meeting	6
15. Communications from the Governing Body	Announcements	6-7
Recessed at 5:27 p.m.		7
Evening Session at 7:00	Quorum Present	8
F. Petitions from the Floor	Petitions Made	8-11
G. Appointments	BTAC Appointments approved	11-14
H. Public Hearings		
1. ADA Placard Violations Amendment	Approved	14-16
2. Planning for SFUAD Resolution	Adopted as amended	16-31
3. Municipal Election Ballot Resolution	Adopted as amended	31-35
I. Adjournment	Adjourned at 10:04 pm	35

**MINUTES OF THE
REGULAR MEETING OF THE
GOVERNING BODY
Santa Fe, New Mexico
August 8, 2018**

AFTERNOON SESSION

1. CALL TO ORDER AND ROLL CALL

A regular meeting of the Governing Body of the City of Santa Fe, New Mexico, was called to order by Mayor Alan Webber, on Wednesday, August 8, 2018, at approximately 5:04 p.m., in the Council Chambers at City Hall, 200 Lincoln Avenue, Santa Fe, New Mexico. Following the Pledge of Allegiance, Salute to the New Mexico flag, and the Invocation, roll call indicated the presence of a quorum, as follows:

Members Present

Mayor Alan Webber
Councilor Signe I. Lindell, Mayor Pro-Tem
Councilor Roman "Tiger" Abeyta
Councilor Mike Harris
Councilor Peter N. Ives
Councilor Christopher M. Rivera
Councilor Carol Romero-Wirth
Councilor JoAnne Vigil Coppler
Councilor Renee D. Villarreal

Members Excused

None

Others Attending

Nick Schiavo for Erik Litzenberg, City Manager
Erin McSherry, City Attorney
Yolanda Y. Vigil, City Clerk
Carl Boaz, Council Stenographer

6. APPROVAL OF AGENDA

MOTION: Councilor Harris moved, seconded by Councilor Ives, to approve the agenda, as amended with an official proclamation during Presentations.

VOTE: The motion was approved on a voice vote with Mayor Webber and Councilors Abeyta, Harris, Ives, Lindell, Rivera, Romero-Wirth, Vigil Coppler and Villarreal voting in favor of the motion and none voting against.

7. APPROVAL OF CONSENT CALENDAR

Councilor Lindell requested discussion on Item 10(g).

Councilor Harris noted in item 10 (h), there are some amendments and it was unclear and mechanical - if we need to acknowledge the amendments.

Councilor Harris requested discussion on Item 10(h)

Ms. Vigil explained that the amendments are on each Councilor's desk.

MOTION: Councilor Abeyta moved, seconded by Councilor Rivera, to approve the Consent Agenda as amended with items 10 (g) and (h) removed for discussion.

Councilor Harris saw the amendments to item 10 (h) are here, so he did not need to remove it.

Councilor Lindell thought that it would be removed because she hadn't had a chance to match it with legislation.

Councilor Ives asked for clarification on items g and h being removed for discussion since there were proposed amendments.

Ms. Vigil clarified the motion is to approve with items g and h removed for discussion.

VOTE: The motion was approved on the following Roll Call vote:

For: Mayor Webber, Councilor Abeyta, Councilor Harris, Councilor Ives, Councilor Lindell, Councilor Rivera, Councilor Romero-Wirth, Councilor Vigil Coppler and Councilor Villarreal.

Against: None.

8. APPROVAL OF MINUTES: Regular City Council Meeting – July 25, 2018

MOTION: Councilor Ives moved, seconded by Councilor Lindell, to approve the minutes of July 25, 2018 as presented.

VOTE: The motion was approved on a voice vote with Mayor Webber and Councilors Abeyta, Harris, Ives, Lindell, Rivera, Romero-Wirth, Vigil Coppler and Villarreal voting in favor and none voting against.

9. PRESENTATIONS

All Council members came forward and Councilor Harris read a proclamation in honor of the Flood Response and Community Recognition Day that identified the numerous groups who helped with responses to the flood.

Mayor Webber proclaimed Aug 8, 2018 as Flood Response and Recovery Community Recognition Day.

10. CONSENT AGENDA

- a) Request for Approval of Memorandum of Understanding for Continued City Involvement in the LEAD Policy Coordinating Committee; No Fiscal Impact. (Julie Sanchez)
- b) Request for the Approval of Vendor Agreement #2018-19-60026 in the Total Amount of \$784,503.90 for FY 2018/19 for Direct Purchase of Services - Congregate Meals, Home Delivered Meals, Transportation, Homemaker/Housekeeping, In-Home Respite Care and GRGC Respite Vouchers; North Central New Mexico Economic Development District Non-Metro Area Agency. (Gino Rinaldi)
- c) Request for Approval of Award of RFP 18/34/P and Professional Services Agreement in the Total Amount of \$280,000, Plus NMGRT, for Database Development, Training and Support Services for Utility Billing Division; Mountain River Consulting. (Joshua Elicio).
- d) Request for Approval of Award of the Fire Department Uniform Bid (18-26-B) in the Amount to Exceed \$60,000 for Uniforms to Multiple Vendors; Galls, Capital City Uniforms, LN Curtis, Roadrunner Screen Printers. (Jan Snyder)

- e) Request for Approval of Budget Amendment for Local Match on Approved New Mexico Department of Transportation (NMDOT) Grant Agreement SAF-18-05 in the Amount of \$120,797 for the Santa Fe Municipal Airport. (Nick Schiavo and Mark Baca)

- f) Request for Approval of Procurement in the Amount of \$1,040,040 (Inclusive of NMGRT) for Two (2) Heavy Duty 30-Foot Low-Floor CNG Near Zero Emissions Buses Via Cooperative Agreement from the State of Virginia Cooperative Agreement #E194-75548 MA 2274; Gillig LLC. (Keith Wilson)
 - 1) Request for Approval of Amendment No. 1 to Contract #18-0554 to Add the Purchase of Two Buses and Extend the Term of the Agreement to July 31, 2021.

- g) Pulled for discussion by Councilor Lindell

- h) Pulled for discussion by Harris

- i) Request for Approval of Professional Services Agreement in the Amount of \$124,689.28 for the Development/Design Services for the Agua Fria/South Meadows Intersection Improvement Project; Santa Fe Engineering. (David Quintana)
 - 1) Request for Approval of Budget Amendment in the Amount of \$200,000.

CONSENT CALENDAR DISCUSSION

- g) CONSIDERATION OF RESOLUTION NO. 2018-52. (Councilor Villarreal and Councilor Ives)
A Resolution in Support of Reauthorization of and Full Funding for the Land and Water Conservation Fund. (Jesse Guillen)

A copy of the proposed amendments by Councilor Ives to Resolution No. 2018-52 is incorporated herewith to these minutes as Exhibit 1.

Councilor Lindell said she now has matched it with legislation.

MOTION: Councilor Lindell moved, seconded by Councilor Villarreal to approve Resolution No. 2018-52.



Agenda

REGULAR MEETING OF
THE GOVERNING BODY
AUGUST 29, 2018
SANTA FE COUNTY FAIRGROUNDS
EXHIBIT HALL
3229 RODEO ROAD

AFTERNOON SESSION – 5:00 P.M.

1. CALL TO ORDER
2. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
3. SALUTE TO THE NEW MEXICO FLAG
4. INVOCATION
5. ROLL CALL
6. APPROVAL OF AGENDA
7. APPROVAL OF CONSENT CALENDAR
8. APPROVAL OF MINUTES: Regular City Council Meeting – August 8, 2018
9. PRESENTATIONS
 - a) Muchas Gracias to the City of Santa Fe Fire Department Rapid Extrication Module Team – Rescue of Two Wildland Firefighters at the San Antonio Fire on June 19, 2018. (Assistant Chief Babcock)
10. CONSENT CALENDAR
 - a) Request for Approval of Procurement in the Amount of \$398,868 Using Cooperative Educational Service Agreement for a Sewer Vactor Truck as the Replacement of FA #51040 for the Wastewater Management Division; Pete's Equipment Repair, Inc. (Jerry Tapia)
 - b) Request for Approval of Amendment No. 1 to Professional Services Agreement in the Amount of \$13,400.91, Exclusive of NMGRT, for the Installation of Network Communication Cable for Data and Video Network Services for the Water Division and Utility Billing Division; HEI, Inc. (Shannon Jones)
 - c) CONSIDERATION OF RESOLUTION NO. 2018-____. (Councilor Ives)
A Resolution Adopting the 2020-2024 Infrastructure Capital Improvements Plan (ICIP). (John Romero)

RECEIVED AT THE CITY CLERK'S OFFICE

DATE: August 24, 2018

TIME: 4:30 PM

CITY OF SANTA FE PROCUREMENT CHECKLIST

Contractor Name: Capital City Uniforms, Galls, LN Curtis, Roadrunner Screen Printers

Procurement Title: City of Santa Fe Fire Department Uniforms

Solicitation RFP/RFB#: 18/26/B

Other Methods: State Price Agreement **Cooperative** **Sole Source** **Exempt** **Other**

Department Requesting/Staff Member: Fire Department / AC Jan Snyder

Procurement Requirements:

A procurement file shall be maintained for all contracts, regardless of the method of procurement. The procurement file shall contain the basis on which the award is made, all submitted bids and proposals, all evaluation materials, score sheets, quotations and all other documentation related to or prepared in conjunction with evaluation, negotiation, and the award process. The procurement shall contain a written determination from the Requesting Department, signed by the procurement officer, setting forth the reasoning for the contract award decision before submitting to the Committees. .

SOLICITATION*

- | YES | N/A | |
|-------------------------------------|-------------------------------------|--|
| <input type="checkbox"/> | <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> | Project Beginning History (council requests etc) |
| <input type="checkbox"/> | <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> | Budget Determination (FIR) attach |
| <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> | <input type="checkbox"/> | Solicitation document (RFP, IFB), |
| <input type="checkbox"/> | <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> | Screen print of legal solicitation published in newspapers, web sites, etc.: |
| <input type="checkbox"/> | <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> | Screen print of addendum(s) published on the IPB/RFP: |
| <input type="checkbox"/> | <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> | Pre-Bid/Pre-Offer Conference attendance sheet and other documents |
| <input type="checkbox"/> | <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> | If canceled, screen print of cancellation of solicitation notice |
| <input type="checkbox"/> | <input type="checkbox"/> | Other: _____ |

EVALUATION*

- | YES | N/A | |
|--------------------------|-------------------------------------|---|
| <input type="checkbox"/> | <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> | Blank evaluation form |
| <input type="checkbox"/> | <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> | Evaluator's names and profiles |
| <input type="checkbox"/> | <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> | Evaluation procedures or evaluation instructions |
| <input type="checkbox"/> | <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> | Conflict/Confidentiality Forms signed by all Evaluators, Technical Advisors, Reviewers, and any person who assists in regard to the bid/proposal, evaluation and/or award |
| <input type="checkbox"/> | <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> | Bid or Offer opening sheet(s) (If RFP, then two offer opening sheets, one for technical and one for cost) |
| <input type="checkbox"/> | <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> | Screen print of Bidder/Offeror's detailed information |
| <input type="checkbox"/> | <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> | Responsiveness review sheet or other sheet documenting responsiveness for each Bidder/Offeror, attach requests for additional information to cure items |
| <input type="checkbox"/> | <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> | Non-Responsive/Non-Responsibility Form and correspondence or letters from Department to vendor regarding disqualifications |
| <input type="checkbox"/> | <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> | Oral presentations (sign-in sheets, presentation materials, etc.) |
| <input type="checkbox"/> | <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> | Documentation sent to Bidders/Offerors and responses received regarding clarifications, decisions, negotiations, and/or best and final offers, etc. |
| <input type="checkbox"/> | <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> | Reference Reviews/Reference Check Questionnaires |
| <input type="checkbox"/> | <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> | Individual evaluations included for each RFP. |
| <input type="checkbox"/> | <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> | Pricing evaluation |
| <input type="checkbox"/> | <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> | Final overall evaluation matrix or summary of evaluator scores |
| <input type="checkbox"/> | <input type="checkbox"/> | Other: _____ |

*

AWARD*

YES N/A

- Fully executed Memo to Committees from the Department with recommendation of award
- Winning proposal (this is a copy that has all confidential/proprietary information excluded)
- Screen print of Contract Award Notice
- Screen print of Award Notice published on agency website
- Email or notification sent to all Bidders/Offerors that award was made
- Waiver or "No Action Taken" from Procurement Office
- Correspondence with Procurement Office regarding waiver
- If IFB and not awarded to lowest responsive, responsible bidder; written explanation
- Other: _____

DISCLOSURES

YES N/A

- Contractor Disclosures & Conflicts of Interest**
- Disclosures & Conflicts of Interest Form(s) (winning bidder(s)/offeror(s))
- Contractor –Conflicts of Interest**
- Purchasing Office Letter or e-mail to designated individual regarding potential conflict
- Conflict of Interest Form signed by all parties
- Letter from Procurement Office regarding the potential conflict
- Subcontractor Disclosures**
- Disclosures & Conflicts of Interest form of Subcontractor(s)
- Subcontractor –Conflicts of Interest**
- Purchasing Officer Letter or email to designated individual regarding potential conflict
- Conflict of Interest form signed by all parties
- Letter from Legal Office regarding the potential conflict
- Other: _____

CONTRACT

YES N/A

- Copy of Executed Contract
- Copy of all documentation presented to the Committees
- Finalized Council Committee Minutes
- Other: _____

MISCELLANEOUS FILE*

YES N/A

- Local Preference Form
- New Mexico Residence Form
- Veterans Exemption
- Sole Source determination form approved by Procurement Officer**
- Exempt determination memo approved by Procurement Officer**
- Other: _____

Include all other substantive documents and records of communication that pertain to the procurement and any resulting contract.

PROTEST (If applicable)*

YES N/A

- Documentation from protester filed with the Purchasing Office
- Letter from Department to Purchasing Office Providing response to protest
- Letter from Purchasing Officer to protester and Department on final outcome
- Other: _____

Create a separate file folder which may contain any documents with trade secrets or other competitively sensitive, confidential or proprietary information.

YES N/A

- Original bid(s) or proposal(s) with no redactions.
- Documentation exempt - Proprietary, Confidential, Competitively Sensitive, or Trade Secret (i.e. e-mails, proposals, letters)


Jan M Snyder / Asst. Chief
Department Rep Printed Name and Title

[Signature]
Department Rep Signature attesting that all information included

[Signature]
Purchasing Officer attesting that all information is reviewed

City of Santa Fe, New Mexico

memo

DATE: June 20, 2018
TO: Finance Committee
City Council
FROM: Jan M Snyder, Assistant Fire Chief 
SUBJECT: Fire Department Uniform Bid Award (18/26/B)
VIA: Shirley Rodriguez, Procurement Analyst

The City of Santa Fe Fire Department recently went out to bid for its station uniforms package. These items include; hats, shirts, pants, boots, jackets, Class-A uniforms, silk screening and embroidery costs.

Capital City Uniforms, LN Curtis & Sons, Gall's, and Roadrunner Screen Printers submitted responses and were award bids.

We would like approval to accept the bid(s) and its terms and to spend over \$50,000.00 with any of the vendors during the duration of the bid if that threshold shall occur.

Funds for these purchases will come from the Department's General Fund unit 12087.530500 (uniform, clothing, linens)

Please find attached an abridged version of each bid that was submitted.

Attachments: (5) Bid 18/26/B Package (abridged)
Vendor Price Sheets (4)

CITY OF SANTA FE

PURCHASING OFFICE

BID TABULATION SHEET

DATE: 6/19/2018	L.N. Curtis Santa Fe.	Galls LLC Kentucky	Capitol City Uniforms, Santa Fe	Road Runner Screen Printer, Santa Fe
BID: '18/26/B				
PREPARED BY: Nathan S.				
ITEM & DESCRIPTION	BID AMOUNT	BID AMOUNT	BID AMOUNT	BID AMOUNT
Class A Cover - Hat Badge Chief	No Bid	\$135.00	\$56.00	No Bid
Class A Cover - Hat Badge Captains	No Bid	\$135.00	\$56.00	No Bid
Class A Cover - Hat Badge LT	No Bid	\$135.00	\$11.00	No Bid
Class A Cover - Hat Badge Firefighter	No Bid	\$125.00	\$56.00	No Bid
Ball Cap	No Bid	\$13.99	\$20.00	No Bid
Ball Cap-Wildland	No Bid	\$13.99	\$20.00	\$17.00
Ball Cap-wildland Mesh	No Bid	\$13.99	\$19.50	No Bid
Ball Cap-Alt Mesh	No Bid	\$13.99	\$19.50	No Bid
Ball Cap- Alt Mesh2	No Bid	\$13.99	\$12.00	No Bid
Knit Watch Cap W/SFFD Maltese	No Bid	\$10.99	No Bid	No Bid
Fleece Watch Cap w/SFFD Maltese	No Bid	\$10.99	No Bid	No Bid
Boonie Hat	No Bid	\$17.99	\$25.00	No Bid
Class A Chief Officer Jacket	No Bid	\$179.99	No Bid	No Bid
Class A Jacket	No Bid	\$179.99	No Bid	No Bid
Winter Jacket Mens 48073-724	No Bid	\$269.99	\$333.00	No Bid
Fleece Jacket	No Bid	\$109.00	\$130.00	No Bid
Softshell Jacket	No Bid	\$119.00	\$145.00	No Bid
Wildland Work Jacket J131	No Bid	\$74.99	\$75.00	No Bid
Training Div. Work Jacket C61	No Bid	\$119.99	\$130.00	No Bid
Training Div. Hooded Jacket 101300	No Bid	\$99.00	No Bid	No Bid
SFFD Uniform Sweatshirt	No Bid	\$19.99	\$34.00	\$35.00
Wildland Hoodie wildland Team	No Bid	\$28.99	\$20.04	\$30.00
Wildland Hoodie Atalaya Crew P170	No Bid	\$28.99	No Bid	\$30.00
Hazmat Hoodie P170	No Bid	\$28.99	No Bid	\$34.00
PFT Hoodie P170	No Bid	\$28.99	No Bid	\$29.26

SFFD Instructor Hoodie P170	No Bid	\$28.99	No Bid	\$30.26
Auto-X Hoodie P170	No Bid	\$28.99	No Bid	\$20.00
Officer's Shirt Long Sleeve 35W5400	No Bid	\$48.99	No Bid	No Bid
Officer's Shirt Short Sleeve 85R5400	No Bid	\$48.99	No Bid	No Bid
Class A Shirt Long Sleeve 15W5425	No Bid	\$54.99	\$40.00	No Bid
Class B Shirt Long Sleeve SH95	No Bid	\$146.99	No Bid	\$100.00
Class B Shirt Short Sleeve SH96	No Bid	\$139.99	\$83.00	\$95.00
Class C T Shirt Long Sleeve Beefy -T	No Bid	\$14.99	\$18.25	\$25.00
Class C T Shirt Short Sleeve Beefy-T	No Bid	\$12.99	\$16.25	\$21.50
Class C T Short Sleeve Beefy-T	No Bid	\$12.99	\$16.25	No Bid
Class C T Short Sleeve Beefy-T	No Bid	\$12.99	\$16.25	\$24.00
Alt Tshirt- Short Sleeve	No Bid	\$12.99	\$16.25	No Bid
Wildland T Shirt Short Sleeve Beefy-T	No Bid	\$12.99	\$16.25	\$20.00
Wildland T Shirt Long Sleeve Beefy-T	No Bid	\$12.99	\$18.25	\$24.00
Wildland Atalaya Short Sleeve Beefy-T	No Bid	\$12.99	\$16.25	\$20.00
Wildland Atalaya Long Sleeve Beefy-T	No Bid	\$12.99	\$16.25	\$24.00
Haz-Mat Short Sleeve Beefy-T	No Bid	\$12.99	\$16.25	\$18.00
HRT Short Sleeve Beefy-T	No Bid	\$12.99	\$16.25	\$15.00
HRT Long Sleeve Beefy-T	No Bid	\$14.99	\$18.50	\$16.00
PFT T-Shirt L/S Men 519698	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
PFT T-Shirt L/S Women 519698	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Auto-X T-Shirt Short Sleeve Beefy-T	No Bid	\$12.99	\$16.50	No Bid
Auto-X T-Shirt Long Sleeve Beefy-T	No Bid	\$12.99	\$18.50	No Bid
Polo Shirt Short Sleeve Men 71182	No Bid	\$39.99	\$43.00	No Bid
Polo Shirt Long Sleeve Men 72360	No Bid	\$44.99	\$48.00	No Bid
Polo Shirt Women's 61164	No Bid	\$39.99	\$43.00	No Bid
Training Div. BDU Blouse	No Bid	\$29.99	\$80.04	No Bid
Class-A Pant	No Bid	\$51.99	\$42.00	No Bid
Chiefs Pant lionwear	No Bid	\$66.99	No Bid	No Bid
Chiefs pant flying cross	No Bid	\$64.99	No Bid	No Bid
Class B/C pant PA087905	No Bid	\$143.99	\$130.00	No Bid
Class B/C pant PA657905	No Bid	\$179.99	\$100.00	No Bid
Class B/C pant- Womens	No Bid	\$135.00	No Bid	No Bid
Class B/C pant- Womens I1160c00	No Bid	\$61.99	No Bid	No Bid
Training Div. Bib Overalls	No Bid	\$79.99	\$80.00	No Bid
Haz-mat Sweat pants	No Bid	\$19.83	No Bid	\$18.00

PFT Sweatpants- Mens	No Bid	\$41.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
PFT Sweatpants- Womens	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
SFFD Instructor Sweat Pants	No Bid	\$15.99	No Bid	No Bid	\$22.60
PFT shorts- Mens	No Bid	\$34.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$30.00
PFT Shorts-Womens	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$24.00
SFFD Instructor Shorts- Mens	No Bid	\$34.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
PFT Swim Trunks- Mens	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Boot Honey Well 3003	No Bid	\$306.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Boot Thorogood 804-6446	No Bid	\$80.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Boot 5.11 12026	\$110.00	\$154.99	\$170.00	No Bid	No Bid
Boot Haix Airpower R1-Men	No Bid	\$333.99	No Bid	No Bid	\$280.00
Boot Haix Airpower R2- Men	No Bid	\$313.99	No Bid	No Bid	\$280.00
Boot Haix Airpower R1- Women	No Bid	\$333.99	No Bid	No Bid	\$275.00
Boot Haix Airpower R2- Women	No Bid	\$298.99	No Bid	No Bid	\$275.00
Boots Women 5.11 12145	\$110.00	\$154.99	\$170.00	No Bid	No Bid
Boots- Chiefs Thorngood	No Bid	\$117.00	\$140.00	No Bid	No Bid
Boots- Chiefs 5.11	\$97.00	\$139.99	\$160.00	No Bid	No Bid
Boots- Chiefs 5.11 12354	\$129.00	\$179.99	\$180.00	No Bid	No Bid
Boots- Fire Honeywell	No Bid	\$515.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Boots- Fire Globe	\$385.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Class A Shoe Men 510-8	No Bid	\$69.95	\$80.00	No Bid	No Bid
Class A Shoe Men 22141	No Bid	\$69.95	\$125.00	No Bid	No Bid
Class A Shoe Women Bates 210-8	No Bid	\$69.95	\$85.00	No Bid	No Bid
Class A Shoe Women Bates 22741	No Bid	\$69.95	\$130.00	No Bid	No Bid
Belt Dutyman 1511	No Bid	\$22.95	\$25.04	No Bid	No Bid
Belt Dutyman 1611		\$20.99	\$22.00	No Bid	No Bid
Belt 5.11 59405-019	\$27.95	\$39.99	\$43.00	No Bid	No Bid
Belt Blackhawk CBQ	No Bid	\$31.99	\$42.50	No Bid	No Bid
Class A Tie Men	No Bid	\$5.99	\$6.00	No Bid	No Bid
Class A Tie Women	No Bid	\$5.99	\$6.00	No Bid	No Bid
Tie Clip	No Bid	\$5.99	\$6.50	No Bid	No Bid
Class-A Cover Accessories A2866	No Bid	\$17.00	\$32.00	No Bid	No Bid
Class-A Cover Accessories SNL40	No Bid	\$16.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Class-A Cover Accessories A2867	No Bid	\$21.00	\$33.00	No Bid	No Bid

Class-A Cover Accessories TCC	No Bid	\$2.99	No Bid	No Bid	
Class A Jacket Accessories	No Bid	\$2.99	No Bid	No Bid	
Class A Jacket Accessories Blackington	No Bid	\$14.20	\$23.00	No Bid	
Class A Jacket Accessories Midway	No Bid	\$14.20	\$14.00	No Bid	
Class A&B Shirt Insignia	No Bid	\$23.20	\$40.00	No Bid	
Class A&B Shirt Insignia	No Bid	\$23.20	\$40.00	No Bid	
Chiefs Badge B1009	No Bid	\$62.50	\$65.00	No Bid	
Captain LT Badge B1009	No Bid	\$62.50	\$65.00	No Bid	
Badge FF Eng Rescue Para B1009	No Bid	\$62.50	\$65.00	No Bid	
Badge Retired B1009	No Bid	\$62.50	\$65.00	No Bid	
SFFD Patch	No Bid	\$3.00	\$5.00	No Bid	
SFFD Retired Patch	No Bid	\$3.00	\$5.00	No Bid	
SFFD EMT-P Patch	No Bid	\$3.00	\$4.50	No Bid	
SFFD EMT-I Patch	No Bid	\$3.00	\$4.50	No Bid	
SFFD EMT-B Patch	No Bid	\$3.00	\$4.50	No Bid	
Name Plate	No Bid	\$12.99	No Bid	No Bid	
Winter Gloves A511	No Bid	\$23.99	No Bid	No Bid	
Winter Helmet Liner Mask A267	No Bid	\$16.99	No Bid	No Bid	
Embroidery Only					
Full Color SFFD Maltese Cross left chest	No Bid	\$5.99	\$7.50	\$10.00	
Single color SFFD Maltese Cross Left C	No Bid	\$5.99	\$7.50	\$7.25	
Full Color SFFD Maltese Cross initials-	No Bid	\$8.99	\$8.00	\$12.75	
Silk Screening Only					
Full Color	No Bid	\$3.99	\$8.50	\$8.55	
Single Color	No Bid	\$3.99	\$8.50	\$5.00	
White or single color	No Bid	\$5.99	\$8.50	\$5.00	
Full Color	No Bid	\$5.99	No Bid	\$7.25	

